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PRICE Del.$125/Pickup $125
4 days PER NO BID NO BID 247.00 340.00 632.85 355.00 235.00 270.88
Item 1 Crawler Loader Diesel 1/2 yard, Mfg. TAKEUCHI, Model TL130 DAY 988.00 1,610.00 2,5631.40 1,420.00 940.00 1,083.52
PRICE Del.$125/Pickup $125
2 weeks PER NO BID NO BID 713.00 970.00 1,384.46 1,050.00 700.00 812.63
Crawler Loader Diesel 1/2 yard, Mfg. TAKEUCHI, Model TL130 Week 1,426.00 2,190.00 2,768.92 2,100.00 1,400.00 1,625.26
PRICE Del.$125/Pickup $125
1 month PER NO BID NO BID 1,604.00 2,305.00 2,088.37 2,565.00 2,100.00 1,768.08
Crawler Loader Diesel 1/2 yard, Mfg. TAKEUCHI, Model TL130 MONTH 1,604.00 2,555.00 2,088.37 2,565.00 2,100.00 1,768.08
Manufacturer/Model Bobcat T590 John Deere 319E Cat 249 245 Deere 323E
*
NO BID NO BID
ITEM 1 TOTAL TOTAL 4,018.00 6,355.00 7,388.69 6,085.00 4,440.00 4,476.86
PRICE Del.$125/Pickup $125
4 days PER NO BID NO BID 247.00 350.00 679.50 NO BID 300.00 287.34
Item 2 Compact Rubber Track Laoder Series 3, Mfg. Case, Model 420CT DAY 988.00 1,650.00 2,718.00 1,200.00 1,149.36
PRICE Del.$125/Pickup $125
2 weeks PER NO BID NO BID 713.00 1,025.00 1,304.63 NO BID 910.00 881.58
Compact Rubber Track Laoder Series 3, Mfg. Case, Model 420CT Week 1,426.00 2,300.00 2,609.26 1,820.00 1,763.16
PRICE Del.$125/Pickup $125
1 month PER NO BID NO BID 1,604.00 2,495.00 3,172.76 NO BID 2,730.00 1,945.38
Compact Rubber Track Laoder Series 3, Mfg. Case, Model 420CT MONTH 1,604.00 2,745.00 3,172.76 2,730.00 1,945.38
Manufacturer/Model Bobcat T630 Bobcat t650 Deere 329E Bobcat T630
*
NO BID NO BID NO BID
ITEM 2 TOTAL TOTAL 4,018.00 6,695.00 8,500.02 5,750.00 4,857.90
PRICE Del.$125/Pickup $125
4 days PER NO BID NO BID 269.00 365.00 684.68 445.00 325.00 512.00
Item 3 Compact Rubber Track Loader Series 3, Mfg. Case, Model 440CT DAY 1,076.00 1,710.00 2,738.72 1,780.00 1,300.00 2,048.00
PRICE Del.$125/Pickup $125
2 weeks PER NO BID NO BID 779.00 1,325.00 1,514.04 1,320.00 980.00 1,275.00
Compact Rubber Track Loader Series 3, Mfg. Case, Model 440CT Week 1,558.00 2,900.00 3,028.08 2,640.00 1,960.00 2,550.00
PRICE Del.$125/Pickup $125
1 month PER NO BID NO BID 1,898.00 3,080.00 3,267.24 3,100.00 2,940.00 2,750.00
Compact Rubber Track Loader Series 3, Mfg. Case, Model 440CT MONTH 1,898.00 3,330.00 3,267.24 3,100.00 2,940.00 2,750.00
Manufacturer/Model Bobcat T740 John Deere 329D Cat 289 Deere 323E Bobcat T740
*
NO BID NO BID
ITEM 3 TOTAL TOTAL 4,532.00 7,940.00 9,034.04 7,520.00 6,200.00 7,348.00
PRICE Del.$125/Pickup $125
4 days PER NO BID NO BID 270.00 275.00 235.00 175.00 270.44
Item 4 D-Series Compact Excavator 325, Mfg. Bobcat Kubota, Model D1703-EB DAY 1,080.00 1,350.00 NO BID 940.00 700.00 1,081.76
PRICE Del.$125/Pickup $125
2 weeks PER NO BID NO BID 753.00 800.00 695.00 525.00 723.98
D-Series Compact Excavator 325, Mfg. Bobcat Kubota, Model D1703-EB Week 1,506.00 1,850.00 NO BID 1,390.00 1,050.00 1,447.96
PRICE Del.$125/Pickup $125
1 week PER NO BID NO BID 2,059.00 1,675.00 1,750.00 1,575.00 1,699.13
D-Series Compact Excavator 325, Mfg. Bobcat Kubota, Model D1703-EB MONTH 2,059.00 1,925.00 NO BID 1,750.00 1,575.00 1,699.13
Manufacturer/Model John Deere 27D Cat 303.5 Deere 17G Bobcat E35
*
NO BID NO BID
ITEM 4 TOTAL TOTAL 4,645.00 5,125.00 NO BID 4,080.00 3,325.00 4,228.85
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PRICE
4 days PER NO BID NO BID 183.00 492.73 175.00 175.00 221.63
Item 5 Compact Excavator, Mfg. Case, Model CX17B DAY 732.00 NO BID 1,970.92 700.00 700.00 886.52
PRICE
2 weeks PER NO BID NO BID 702.00 802.31 510.00 525.00 615.63
Compact Excavator, Mfg. Case, Model CX17B Week 1,404.00 NO BID 1,604.62 1,020.00 1,050.00 1,231.26
PRICE
1 week PER NO BID NO BID 1,587.00 1,596.17 1,450.00 1,575.00 1,472.58
Compact Excavator, Mfg. Case, Model CX17B MONTH 1,587.00 NO BID 1,596.17 1,450.00 1,575.00 1,472.58
Manufacturer/Model Volvo EC20C Cat 301.7 Deere 17G Takeuchi TB216
*
NO BID NO BID
ITEM5 TOTAL TOTAL 3,723.00 NO BID 5171.71 3,170.00 3,325.00 3,590.36
PRICE Del.$125/Pickup $125
4 days PER NO BID NO BID 183.00 275.00 545.86 225.00 200.00 236.64
Item 6 Compact Excavator CX27B, Mfg. Case, Model CX27B DAY 732.00 1,350.00 2,183.44 900.00 800.00 946.56
PRICE Del.$125/Pickup $125
2 weeks PER NO BID NO BID 702.00 800.00 1,094.51 660.00 595.00 645.18
Compact Excavator CX27B, Mfg. Case, Model CX27B Week 1,404.00 1,850.00 2,189.02 1,320.00 1,190.00 1,290.36
PRICE Del.$125/Pickup $125
1 month PER NO BID NO BID 1,587.00 1,675.00 2,619.91 1,600.00 1,785.00 1,551.38
Compact Excavator CX27B, Mfg. Case, Model CX27B MONTH 1,587.00 1,925.00 2,619.91 1,600.00 1,785.00 1,551.38
Manufacturer/Model John Deere 27D Volvo EC35C Cat 302.7 Deere 26G Bobcat E26
*
NO BID NO BID
ITEM 6 TOTAL TOTAL 3,723.00 5,125.00 6,992.37 3,820.00 3,775.00 3,788.30
PRICE Del.$125/Pickup $125
4 days PER NO BID NO BID 270.00 310.00 545.86 235.00 225.00 270.44
Item 7 Compact Excavator CX31B, Mfr. Case, Model CX31B DAY 1,080.00 1,490.00 2,183.44 940.00 900.00 1,081.76
PRICE Del.$125/Pickup $125
2 weeks PER NO BID NO BID 753.00 880.00 1,094.51 695.00 665.00 723.98
Compact Excavator CX31B, Mfr. Case, Model CX31B Week 1,506.00 2,010.00 2,189.02 1,390.00 1,330.00 1,447.96
PRICE Del.$125/Pickup $125
1 month PER NO BID NO BID 2,059.00 1,675.00 2,619.91 1,750.00 1,995.00 1,699.13
Compact Excavator CX31B, Mfr. Case, Model CX31B MONTH 2,059.00 1,925.00 2,619.91 1,750.00 1,995.00 1,699.13
Manufacturer/Model Bobcat E32 Volvo EC35C Cat 303 Deere 35G Bobcat E35
*
NO BID NO BID
ITEM 7 TOTAL TOTAL 4,645.00 5,425.00 6,992.37 4,080.00 4,225.00 4,228.85
PRICE Del.$125/Pickup $125
4 days PER NO BID NO BID 204.00 325.00 568.34 235.00 225.00 270.44
Item 8 Compact Excavator CX36B, Mfr. Case, Model CX36B DAY 816.00 1,550.00 2,273.36 940.00 900.00 1,081.76
PRICE Del.$125/Pickup $125
2 weeks PER NO BID NO BID 735.00 985.00 1,055.69 695.00 665.00 723.98
Compact Excavator CX36B, Mfr. Case, Model CX36B Week 1,470.00 2,220.00 2,111.38 1,390.00 1,330.00 1,447.96
PRICE Del.$125/Pickup $125
1 month PER NO BID NO BID 1,639.00 1,855.00 2,151.97 1,750.00 1,995.00 1,699.13
Compact Excavator CX36B, Mfr. Case, Model CX36B MONTH 1,639.00 2,105.00 2,151.97 1,750.00 1,995.00 1,699.13
Manufacturer/Model Bobcat E42 Volvo EC55C Cat 303.5 Deere 35G Bobcat E35
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*
NO BID NO BID
ITEM 8 TOTAL TOTAL 3,925.00 5,875.00 6,536.71 4,080.00 4,225.00 4,228.85
PRICE Del.$125/Pickup $125
4 days PER NO BID NO BID 270.00 410.00 568.34 295.00 280.00 315.52
Item 9 Compact Excavator CX50B, Mfr. Case, Model CX50B DAY 1,080.00 1,890.00 2,273.36 1,180.00 1,120.00 1,262.08
PRICE Del.$125/Pickup $125
2 weeks PER NO BID NO BID 753.00 1,010.00 1,055.69 885.00 840.00 881.58
Compact Excavator CX50B, Mfr. Case, Model CX50B Week 1,506.00 2,270.00 2,111.38 1,770.00 1,680.00 1,763.16
PRICE Del.$125/Pickup $125
1 month PER NO BID NO BID 2,059.00 1,925.00 2,151.97 2,150.00 2,520.00 2,063.58
Compact Excavator CX50B, Mfr. Case, Model CX50B MONTH 2,059.00 2,175.00 2,151.97 2,150.00 2,520.00 2,063.58
Takenchi
Manufacturer/Model Bobhcat E50 Volvo EC55C Cat 305 Deere 50G TB26082
*
NO BID NO BID
ITEM 9 TOTAL TOTAL 4,645.00 6,335.00 6,536.71 5,100.00 5,320.00 5,088.82
PRICE
4 days PER NO BID NO BID 267.00 NO BID 591.38 735.00 225.00 585.96
Item 10 Load/Backhoe with Hoe Ramp Attachment and Bucket, Mfr. Case, Model 580 Super M Series DAY 1,068.00 2,365.52 2,940.00 900.00 2,343.84
PRICE
2 weeks PER NO BID NO BID 667.00 NO BID 1,168.82 2,205.00 665.00 1,478.55
Load/Backhoe with Hoe Ramp Attachment and Bucket, Mfr. Case, Model 580 Super M Series Week 1,334.00 2,337.64 4,410.00 1,330.00 2,957.10
PRICE
1 month PER NO BID NO BID 2,243.00 NO BID 2,208.63 4,750.00 1,995.00 3,632.94
Load/Backhoe with Hoe Ramp Attachment and Bucket, Mfr. Case, Model 580 Super M Series MONTH 2,243.00 2,208.63 4,750.00 1,995.00 3,632.94
Manufacturer/Model Case 580SN Cat 420 Deere 310
*
NO BID NO BID NO BID
ITEM 10 TOTAL TOTAL 4,645.00 6,911.79 12,100.00 4,225.00 8,033.88
PRICE
4 days PER NO BID NO BID 1,500.00
Item 11 Excavator Tracked, Mfr. Case, Model CX470B DAY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 6,000.00 NO BID
PRICE
2 weeks PER NO BID NO BID 4,500.00
Excavator Tracked, Mfr. Case, Model CX470B Week NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 9,000.00 NO BID
PRICE
1 month PER NO BID NO BID 13,500.00
Excavator Tracked, Mfr. Case, Model CX470B MONTH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 13,500.00 NO BID
Manufacturer/Model Deere 470G
*
NO BID NO BID
ITEM 11 TOTAL TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 28,500.00 NO BID
PRICE
4 days PER NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 990.00 968.91
Item 12 Motor Grader, Mfr. Case, Model 865VHP DAY 3,960.00 3,875.64
PRICE
2 weeks PER NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 2,960.00 3,577.74
Motor Grader, Mfr. Case , Model 865VHP Tier Il Week NO BID NO BID 5,920.00 7,155.48
PRICE
1 month PER NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 8,900.00 8,620.08
Motor Grader, Mfr. Case, Model 865VHP Tier 1ll MONTH NO BID NO BID 8,900.00 8,620.08
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Manufacturer/Model Deere 672G Case 865B
*
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ITEM 12 TOTAL TOTAL NO BID NO BID 18,780.00 19,651.20
PRICE Del.$125/Pickup $125
4 days PER 225.00 NO BID 204.00 410.00 265.00 200.00 315.52
Item 13 D-Series Compact Excavator 331, Mfr. Bobcat Kubota Model VV-2203-EB DAY 900.00 816.00 1,890.00 NO BID 1,060.00 800.00 1,262.08
PRICE Del.$125/Pickup $125
2 weeks PER 675.00 NO BID 735.00 1,010.00 760.00 595.00 881.58
D-Series Compact Excavator 331, Mfr. Bobcat Kubota, Model VV-2203-EB Week 1,350.00 1,470.00 2,270.00 NO BID 1,520.00 1,190.00 1,763.16
PRICE Del.$125/Pickup $125
1 month PER 1,825.00 NO BID 1,639.00 1,925.00 1,950.00 1,785.00 2,063.58
D-Series Compact Excavator 331, Mfr. Bobcat Kubota, Model V-2203-EB MONTH 1,825.00 1,639.00 2,175.00 NO BID 1,950.00 1,785.00 2,063.58
Manufacturer/Model Bobcat E32 Bobcat E50 Cat 304 Deere 26G Takenchi TB260
*
NO BID
ITEM 13 TOTAL TOTAL 4,075.00 3,925.00 6,335.00 NO BID 4,530.00 3,775.00 5,088.82
PRICE Del.$125/Pickup $125
4 days PER NO BID NO BID 337.00 450.00 695.05 450.00 280.00 NO BID
Item 14 Compact Excavator & Skid Loader 442, Mfr. Bobcat, Model 442 DAY 1,348.00 2,050.00 2,780.20 1,800.00 1,120.00
PRICE Del.$125/Pickup $125
2 weeks PER NO BID NO BID 1,021.00 1,450.00 1,576.24 1,285.00 840.00 NO BID
Compact Excavator & Skid Loader 442, Mfr. Bobcat, Model 442 Week 2,042.00 3,150.00 3,152.48 2,570.00 1,680.00
PRICE Del.$125/Pickup $125
1 month PER NO BID NO BID 3,163.00 3,150.00 3,349.00 3,100.00 2,520.00 NO BID
Compact Excavator & Skid Loader 442, Mfr. Bobcat, Model 442 MONTH 3,163.00 3,400.00 3,349.00 3,100.00 2,520.00
Manufacturer/Model Bobcat E85 Volvo ECR 88 Cat 308 Deere 50G
*
NO BID NO BID NO BID
ITEM 14 TOTAL TOTAL 6,553.00 8,600.00 9,281.68 7,470.00 5,320.00
PRICE
4 days PER NO BID NO BID 305.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item 15 Rubber Tire Trencher, Mfr. Astec, Model RT960 DAY 1,220.00
PRICE
2 weeks PER NO BID 5,000.00 965.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Rubber Tire Trencher, Mfr. Astec, Model RT960 Week 10,000.00 1,930.00
PRICE
1 month PER NO BID 13,000.00 2,185.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Rubber Tire Trencher, Mfr. Astec, Model RT960 MONTH 13,000.00 2,185.00
Manufacturer/Model Vermeer RTX1250
*
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ITEM 15 TOTAL TOTAL 23,000.00 5,335.00
PRICE
4 days PER NO BID NO BID 267.00 NO BID NO BID 285.00 225.00 309.88
Item 16 Loader Backhoe with Bucket Attachment DAY 1,068.00 1,140.00 900.00 1,239.52
PRICE
2 weeks PER NO BID NO BID 667.00 NO BID NO BID 855.00 665.00 785.54
Loader Backhoe with Bucket Attachment Week 1,334.00 1,710.00 1,330.00 1,571.08
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PRICE
1 month PER NO BID NO BID 2,243.00 NO BID NO BID 1,800.00 1,995.00 1,908.87
Loader Backhoe with Bucket Attachment MONTH 2,243.00 1,800.00 1,995.00 1,908.87
Manufacturer/Model Cat 416 Deere 310 Case 580N
*
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ITEM 16 TOTAL TOTAL 4,645.00 4,650.00 4,225.00 4,719.47
PRICE
4 days PER 6,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item 17 Rock Trencher Tracked DAY 26,000.00 A
PRICE E
2 weeks PER 12,500.00 i NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Rock Trencher Tracked Week 25,000.00 8 =
PRICE <4
1 month PER 35,000.00 ,': % NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Rock Trencher Tracked MONTH 35,000.00 283
~ Z
N =
P
Manufacturer/Model Vermeer T755 H
— =
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ITEM 17 TOTAL TOTAL 86,000.00
TOTAL FOR ITEMS AWARDED 86,000.00 30,196.00 7,250.00 68,150.00
EXTENSION 1 86,000.00 30,196.00 7,250.00 68,150.00
EXTENSION 2 86,000.00 30,196.00 7,250.00 68,150.00
EXTENSION 3 86,000.00 30,196.00 7,250.00 68,150.00
0% Net Net Net Net Net Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days
Delivery Days 72 hrs 72 hrs 48 hours 24 hrs 96 hrs 8 hrs 24 hrs
*LOW BIDDER
BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
ASCO Rocky Hill Equipment Demandstar
Aztec Rental RSC Equipment Rental SAWS Website

BlueLine Rental, LLC
Equipment Depot

Herc Rentals

Hertz Equipment Rental
Neff Rental

RDO Equipment Co.

Sunbelt Rental

Texas First Rentals

Tool Belt
United Rentals
Vermeer




